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This list may not include all available services in a county; please call 2-1-1 to find other
resources in your area. Also, some information included here may have changed. TCJE does not
endorse any organization's services or religious affiliations, and we cannot guarantee that services will be
provided. Before visiting an organization, please contact them about availability, waitlists, and eligibility
requirements.

Coke County Resources
Community Health Services

Coke County Indigent Health Care Program

PO Drawer M, Bronte, TX 76933 | (325) 473-3621 | (325) 473-3472 | http://www.dshs.state.tx.us

This program provides basic medical services to residents of this county who cannot receive health care
coverage from any other source and who are eligible for the program. Eligibility is based on income and
resources.

Coke County Indigent Health Care Program

PO Box 1209, Robert Lee, TX 76945 | (325) 453-2511 | (325) 453-4338 | http://www.dshs.state.tx.us

This program provides basic medical services to residents of this county who cannot receive health care
coverage from any other source and who are eligible for the program. Eligibility is based on income and
resources.

MHMR Services for the Concho Valley

244 N. Magdalen St., San Angelo, TX 76903 | (325) 658-7750 | http://www.mhmrcv.org/

Provides community mental health services. Use the intake or main phone number to contact an office for
an appointment or to ask for more information about eligibility and programs. The 24-hour crisis hotline is
1-800-375-8965 or (325) 653-5933. These crisis numbers are for people facing an emergency situation,
such as having a homicidal or suicidal thoughts. If your call is an emergency, a crisis team may be sent out
to help manage your situation. If necessary, emergency services may also be contacted to respond to your
crisis.Hours: Monday - Friday, 8 a.m. - 5 p.m.

West Texas VA Health Care System - San Angelo Clinic

2018 Pulliam, San Angelo, TX 76905 | (325) 658-6138 | (325) 658-8104 | http://www.bigspring.va.gov

The San Angelo Community Based Outpatient Clinic (CBOC) is designed to deliver primary care and mental
health services to eligible veterans living in the following counties: Coke, Glasscock, Irion, Reagan, Runnels,
Sterling and Tom Green.

County Probation Offices

Tom Green County Community Supervision & Corrections Department

3036 N. Bryant Blvd., San Angelo, TX 76903 | (325) 659-6544 | (325) 658-6346 | http://www.tdcj.state.tx.us

Education Assistance

The Adult Literacy Council of the Concho Valley

59 E. 6th St, San Angelo, TX 76903 | (325) 657-0013 | (325) 657-0030 | http://alccv.wordpress.com/about/
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The Adult Literacy Council of the Concho Valley is a community based literacy program for the 13 counties
of the Concho Valley.The Council provides free one-on-one or small-group tutoring for: English as a second
language and English Conversation, Computer-assisted GED Preparation, Basic Literacy and Basic Math,
General Keyboarding skills and College Preparatory Work.

Employment Services

Goodwill West Texas

2200 N. 1st St., San Angelo, TX 79603 | (325) 676-7925 or (866) 686-7925 (toll free) | (325) 676-7391 |
http://www.goodwillwesttexas.org/jobs.htm

Goodwill West Texas helps people with barriers to employment find meaningful work. Their employment
specialists will do their best to put you to work in one of their locations, or help you find employment in the
area. Goodwill West Texas also provides Work Adjustment Training. By working one on one with a mentor,
this training program helps individuals build the foundation needed to find and maintain employment in the
community.

Workforce Solutions Concho Valley

202 Henry O. Flipper, San Angelo, TX 76903 | (325) 653-2321 or (800) 996-7589 | 325-655-4649 |
http://www.cvworkforce.org

Job search assistance and resources are available to the public free of charge.

Indigent Defense Services

Lorrie Martin, Coke County Court Coordinator

13 E. 7th, Robert Lee, TX 76945 | (332) 453-2641 | (325) 453-2157 | http://www.co.coke.tx.us

Legal Aid Services

Legal Aid of NorthWest Texas

17 S. Chadbourne Suite 403, San Angelo, TX 76903 | (800) 284-5180 | (325) 655-9012 |
http://www.lanwt.org/contact_sanangelo.asp

Other

Concho Valley Regional Food Bank

1313 South Hill St., San Angelo, TX 76903 | (325) 655-3231 | (325) 658-3987 |
http://conchovalleyfoodbank.org

The Food Bank does not distribute food directly to individuals. Call them or 2-1-1 to find local emergency
food assistance. Hours of operation : 8:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m., Monday through Friday

Tom Green County Veterans Services Office

111 W. Beauregard, San Angelo, TX 76903 | (325) 659-6560 | (325) 653-8657 | http://www.co.tom-
green.tx.us/

The Veterans County Service Office assists veterans, their family members, and survivors in obtaining
federal and state veterans' benefits they have earned through their military service. This office serves Tom
Green County, Coke County, Irion County, and Sterling County. There is no charge for services. Office hours
are 8 AM until noon and 1 PM until 5 PM, Monday through Friday. No appointment is necessary. (Special
hours, nursing home or hospital visits, or house calls can be arranged by appointment, as needed.)

Parole Offices

San Angelo District Parole Office

938 Arroyo, San Angelo, TX 76904 | (325) 947-8644 | (325) 947-8599 | http://www.tdcj.state.tx.us
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Treatment Programs

Alcohol & Drug Abuse Council For The Concho Valley

3553 Houston Harte PO Box 3805, San Angelo, TX 76902 | (325) 224-3481 or 24-Hour Crisis Hotline (800)
880-9641 | (325) 224-4923 | http://www.adaccv.org/

They have three facilities in San Angelo. This address is for administration, prevention programs, a resource
library (open to the public) and adult outpatient treatment. There is also a house for residential treatment
for adult males and a house for residential treatment for women, including those who are pregnant or have
up to 2 children with them that are not over the age of six. If placement is through Texas Department of
State Health Services (TX DSHS) funding, clients must meet certain criteria and income eligibility
guidelines. Some persons with limited income may qualify for sliding scale fee for services.

Alcoholics Anonymous El Paso Central Office (NW Texas Area 66, District 14)

El Paso, TX(915) 562-4081 | http://nwta66.org

Alcoholics Anonymous
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